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I want to thank the Wildlife Society for the invitation to join you 
today and to be able to provide a counterview to State Senator and 
CEO of American Lands Council Jennifer Fielder.     

I am here with an agenda. I’m asking you—the Wildlife Society—to 
write and act upon a policy position statement that is urgent and 
significant to the future of wildlife habitat and conservation: to 
oppose the transfer of federal lands to the states or their sale to 
private interests.   

Before proceeding, I want to summarize the current political context 
and review what is happening now and what is likely to happen next. 
I’ll start with the politicians and corporate interests proposing the 
transfer of federal lands to the states. In places like Utah, this began 
as a litigation strategy to challenge the constitutionality of federal land 
ownership. The problem is that the legal arguments, just as they were 
made years ago, are again without merit.1   

Land transfer advocates next turned to Congress. This was a logical 
next step given how receptive the Republican Party has been to the 
idea of privatizing federal lands.2 The result is recently proposed 
legislation that would either privatize federal lands or make it easier 
(and cost-free) to transfer them to the states.3 The political backlash 
is severe, with opposition from hunting, angling and recreational 
interests providing a new spirited energy to the debate.  

The next move is to likely focus on the so-called “reform,” or more 
likely attempted repeal, of federal land law and by providing state and 
local governments control over the nation’s public lands. In other 
words, the strategy will be to give the states control of federal lands, 
wildlife and resources while leaving the associated economic costs to 
the federal government.   
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Unfortunately, there are a few key issues that are still missing from 
the debate and media coverage and the Wildlife Society can help 
bring these to the public’s attention.   

The National Interest in Federal Public Lands 

The first is to more clearly explain why federal land—and the wildlife 
it supports—is in the national interest. This case has not been made 
sufficiently by today’s defenders of our public lands heritage. It is 
time to do so again because it is not enough to explain the problems 
or risks of transferring or privatizing federal lands, but rather to make 
the affirmative case for why they are in the national interest.  

How could the Wildlife Society do this? It could begin by reviewing 
some history, science, and law and then tell a story of wildlife 
conservation on federal lands.  

To begin, consider the nation’s history with federal public lands. It was 
the federal government, not Western states, which acquired these 
lands from foreign nations and Indian tribes through “purchase or 
conquest.”4 This term, used by the Supreme Court in 1823, reminds 
us of how our federal land system traces back to original Indian title 
and America’s history of western settlement. After a period of federal 
land sales and disposals, much of this public land would eventually be 
retained in federal ownership, with multiple laws recognizing the 
national interest and broad public values associated with these lands.5  

Since these retention decisions were made, the national government, 
and generations of American taxpayers, have financially invested in 
developing, managing, protecting, and restoring these lands. These 
were substantial national investments. Given this history, the 
question becomes how non-Western states and taxpayers would be 
justly compensated if our federal lands were to be transferred or 
privatized? 

Second, consider the science demonstrating the national significance 
of federal lands to wildlife conservation.6 These lands are refuges of 
biodiversity and essential habitat for ESA listed and candidate 
species, and they will become even more important in the future 
because of development taking place on state and private lands.7  

Federal lands are also critically important for our nation’s big game, 
waterfowl and fish. The National Forest System provides an example, 
as it provides roughly 80 percent of the elk, mountain goat, and 
bighorn sheep habitat in the lower 48 states and over 200,000 miles 
of fish-bearing streams and rivers, many of which cross state lines.8  
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The Wildlife Society could synthesize this science and make it useable 
to political decision makers. Here, you may want to focus on scale 
and the transboundary and interstate nature of wildlife conservation, 
such as the role played by federal lands in securing wildlife migration.  

Conserving wildlife and its habitat—just like providing clean water 
and air—must transcend state jurisdictions and necessitates federal 
action. That this long-recognized principle is now being called into 
question tells you just how politically radical and dysfunctional the 
politics has become.   

Third, consider federal land laws and their unmistakable emphasis on 
wildlife conservation and the protection of habitat. Of course, there 
are the dominant use laws governing the National Parks and Wildlife 
Refuges, but also the multiple use and wildlife diversity mandate 
given to the Forest Service and the array of legal tools available to the 
BLM.  Federal land agencies have an obligation, not just the 
discretion, to conserve wildlife and its habitat. With few exceptions, 
states do not have the legislative framework or funding necessary to 
adequately conserve wildlife and its habitat on public lands, especially 
non-game.9  

Following a review of history, science and law, TWS could provide a 
story with some history and contemporary relevance. My suggestion 
is to re-tell the story of the armed occupation of the Malheur 
National Wildlife Refuge. Of all places to occupy and protest federal 
lands, this was not it. Here we have a national wildlife refuge, part of 
a national network and system of lands, which is located along the 
international pacific flyway.  The Refuge, moreover, was established 
to conserve migratory birds, a purpose that is according to the 
Supreme Court the very definition of a “national interest of very 
nearly the first magnitude.”10  

Unanswered Questions 

This story, along with the broader history, science, and the law, 
makes clear the national interest in federal lands. But that is not 
enough.  Next, you must ask transfer advocates to answer all of the 
difficult questions, issues, choices and trade-offs that they have so 
conveniently avoided. Instead of answers, platitudes are offered 
about active management, forest health, access, multiple use, and the 
economic efficiency of state land management.  

The problem is that the vague promises don’t add up.  In most cases 
it is still unclear whether transferred lands would be managed 
primarily as state “trust lands” or rather as state-owned non-trust 
multiple use public lands.  Confusing as it sounds, this distinction is 
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an important one because state trust lands are not public lands as that 
term is commonly understood.11 Transfer proponents exploit the 
public’s confusion about these terms.   

Simplified, state trust land managers have a fiduciary obligation to 
generate revenues for designated trust beneficiaries, most often 
common schools or other public institutions. In contrast, federal 
agencies are obligated by law to manage federal lands for a broader 
set of values in the national interest.12 Congress also made clear that 
economic productivity—or “the greatest dollar return or the greatest 
unit output”—shall not be a determining factor in federal land 
management.13 Why did Congress do this? Because it recognized the 
multiple values associated with public lands that go beyond 
maximizing revenues, such as wildlife conservation and recreation.   

Not explained by transfer advocates are the details of state trust 
management. What happens, for example, when the revenue-
generating trust model conflicts with broader multiple use values, 
such as protecting habitat? What discretion will a state agency have in 
such a situation? Can it act on behalf of fish and wildlife without 
compensating the trust for lost revenue? 

This evasiveness is just the tip of the iceberg, as land transfer 
advocates have failed to address any of the difficult choices and 
trade-offs that go along with managing real public lands.14 For 
instance, how would the states manage their obligations under the 
Endangered Species Act? Because Section 7 of the law would no 
longer be in effect, the obligations would shift to the “no-take” 
provision of Section 9, so how will the states handle and pay for this 
additional responsibility? What will state land use planning processes 
look like or will there be any at all? What will be the role of public 
participation? Will citizens have the ability to legally challenge state 
management and enforce the terms of the trust? What about best 
available science? Will transferred lands be subject to state ballot 
initiatives and balanced budget requirements? What becomes of tribal 
reserved rights and cultural resources found on federal land? What 
about abandoned mines and their associated clean-up costs? What 
happens to reserved water rights that are tied to federal lands? Will 
the pre-existing permittees operating on transferred lands have to pay 
more for their licenses and permits? What fees will be charged for 
hunting or recreational access?  

These and other questions have not been answered because it is far 
easier to disparage, undermine, underfund, and campaign against 
federal land agencies than to actually govern and sort through the 
difficult choices that must be made in federal land management.   
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The Path Forward 

So where does this leave us? To be clear, there are serious challenges 
related to federal lands management and contemporary conservation 
more generally. There are multiple values associated with these lands 
and a long history of disagreement about how to properly balance 
resource use and protection and national and local interests. Public 
land management in a democracy is messy. As I tell my students, get 
over it!   

The solution is not to sell out our public lands legacy or to backslide 
on our foundational environmental and federal land laws, but rather 
to dig in and figure out how they can be more efficiently and 
effectively implemented.  

For example, if the problem is one of economic inefficiency, as the 
American Lands Council and others proclaim,15 then let us explore 
ways for federal agencies to generate more income, such as higher 
royalties for oil and gas development, a new royalty for hard rock 
mining, and increased user and permit fees. As for effectiveness, we 
need to engage state, local and tribal governments, build partnerships, 
and more strategically approach things like NEPA, federal lands 
planning, fire management, and endangered species recovery.  

This is the hard work of governing public lands and we need to get 
back to it.  Thank you again for the opportunity to be here today and 
I look forward to talking about these issues this afternoon.   
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